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Editorial
By Jon A. Brake

Wouldn’t it be nice if the Riley

County Commissioners could run

the County as a business. Stop buy-

ing trucks that sleep three, fix the

roads each year and only spend

what was budgeted? And wouldn’t

it be nice if they did this and low-

ered taxes?

Well, Commissioners Ron Wells,

Bob Boyd, and Dave Lewis tell

people that they want to run the

County like a business but they only

want the part of the business where

the Board of Directors make all of

the decisions.

Commissioners Ron Wells, Bob

Boyd, and Dave Lewis want to

remove the voters of Riley County

from County Business. It is just not

good business to take a new

Ambulance Building to a vote of

the people, a real business would

not do that, the Board would make

that decision. It is not good business

to take the building of a new Riley

County Courthouse to a vote of the

people, what if they turned it down?

And a good businessman or

woman likes to expand, become

bigger, more important.

Commissioners Ron Wells, Bob Boyd, and Dave Lewis want to run Riley County like they would a
business, only they want to run it as their business with no help from the voting public.

Well, this Commission,

Commissioners Ron Wells, Bob Boyd,

and Dave Lewis want to do all of that.

They want to take the people our of

County business and run everything

by themselves. They want to become

the big business in the County and

expand to where the City, School

District, the University, Colleges and

the State of Kansas needs to come to

them form money. 

We are talking lots of money. The

three Commissioners want to appoint

themselves as a building Commission

so that they have control of all of the

large construction projects in Riley

County.

We can not stop Commissioners

Ron Wells, Bob Boyd, and Dave

Lewis from forming a Public Building

Commission. We can not stop

Commissioners Ron Wells, Bob Boyd,

and Dave Lewis from building a new

Courthouse or an Ambulance

Building. We can not stop

Commissioners Ron Wells, Bob Boyd,

and Dave Lewis from financing a $52

million City Parks expansion for wish-

ful thinking.

We can only tell Commissioners

Ron Wells, Bob Boyd, and Dave

Lewis that the Citizens want to control

what is built in Riley County. A

Public Building Commission is not

needed. The voters have approved

everything the City, School District

and the County has put before them

in the past 20 years. Yes, the voter

did turn the County down when

they wanted to build the County Jail

next to the Health Dept. and the

hospital but they passed it at a new

location.

And where is the Manhattan

Mercury on this? The

Commissioner are about to do away

with the voting rights of the public

and all the Mercury can say is, “we

are for it if they have an advisory

board.” How dumb is that, who

appoints the board and the Public

Building Commission can over ride

any advisory board.

Commissioners Ron Wells, Bob

Boyd, and Dave Lewis are on the

wrong path and they need to be told.

We know that a lot of people had

told the Commissioners “I Say No!”

but they continue because there is

someone or some big project that is

pushing the Commissioners in the

direction of a Public Building

Commission and the elimination of

the voters.

KANSAS CITY, Kan. (AP) _

Wyandotte County officials have

moved a step closer to buying the

privately held ballpark where its

minor league baseball team plays. 

The board of commissioners of

the Unified Government of

Wyandotte County and Kansas City,

Kan., on Thursday approved a

measure that provides notice of a

change to the development plan in

the Village West area where the

Kansas City T-Bones play, The

Kansas City Star

(http://bit.ly/JPj6W8 ) reported.

Without the change, the county’s

sale talks with T-Bones owner,

Ehlert Development Corp., would

not have moved ahead. 

The T-Bones attracted fans over

the past decade, but the team and

Wyandotte County officials say pri-

vate ownership of the stadium was not

sustainable. 

``The risk we’re now facing is that

we may lose the T-Bones,’‘ said

Deputy County Administrator Doug

Bach. Losing the team would cost the

community $5 million a year in lost

economic benefits, he said. 

If a deal is reached, the Unified

Government will pay $5.5 million to

acquire the ballpark from Ehlert

Development Corp. and set aside $2.5

million for future repairs and

upgrades. Under the proposed deal,

sales taxes collected by the 111 busi-

nesses in the Village West area would

go to pay off the bonds to finance the

deal by the end of 2017. 

In exchange, among other things,

the T-Bones would have to stay for 20

years, although the government

would have the right to terminate

the lease after the 2015 season. The

team would also be responsible for

operating costs and would have to

keep paying the government 50

cents per ticket, which would go

into a fund for parks and recreation

improvements. 

The Unified Government also

proposes the team share a quarter of

all net profits from non-baseball

activities at the stadium and allow

each high school in the county the

opportunity to rent the stadium one

day a year for $250, plus $50 an

hour for lights. 

``The development agreement

has to be right,’‘ Mayor Mark

Holland said. ``It has to protect the

interest of the taxpayers.’‘ 

``If I was 10 years younger, maybe,''

Praeger said. ``You know there's a part

of me that still has that little fight that

I think, `Yeah, I should do it.' But I just

can't.''

Praeger is a past president of the

National Association of Insurance

Commissioners and chairwoman of its

committee on health insurance and

managed care. But her stance on the

2010 federal health care law has kept

officials in her home state's

Republican-dominated state govern-

ment at a distance.

In 2011, GOP Gov. Sam

Brownback's administration returned a

$31.5 million federal grant for setting

up the computer infrastructure within

Kansas for the state's online insurance

marketplace, a move pushed by con-

servative GOP legislators. In 2012,

Brownback decided against having

the state partner with the federal gov-

ernment on the health insurance mar-

ketplace in Kansas, going against

Praeger's advice.

State Senate Public Health and

Welfare Committee Chairwoman

Mary Pilcher-Cook, a conservative

Shawnee Republican, said Praeger's

stance on the health overhaul has

complicated work on issues surround-

ing it.

``It's very difficult to get informa-

tion that you feel you can trust,''

Pilcher-Cook said.

By JOHN HANNA
AP Political Writer

TOPEKA, Kan. (AP) _ Sandy

Praeger is approaching her final year

as Kansas insurance commissioner

with a national reputation for expertise

on health care issues and a lengthy,

unbroken string of election victories as

a Republican in a GOP-leaning state.

But after winning three primaries

and three general elections for the

commissioner's job by comfortable

margins, Praeger acknowledges that

she'd have trouble emerging from next

year's GOP primary. She wondered

during an interview whether her

endorsement would be toxic for any

Republican seeking to replace her.

The reason is the unusual niche

she's carved for herself within the

GOP on health care issues. She argues

that the federal health care overhaul

championed by President Barack

Obama and his fellow Democrats was

a positive step that could help millions

of uninsured Americans and that, even

with the problems with its administra-

tion, it's an improvement.

Asked during a recent Associated

Press interview about being among

only a handful of prominent

Republicans taking such a stance pub-

licly, Praeger laughed and suggested

there may be no others.

``I would be curious as to who they

are, because I don't know them,'' she

joked. Later, growing serious, she

said, ``It's just the reality of the situa-

tion. I have been probably the most

vocal Republican that has said this is

better than what we had and we

should try to make this work.''

Praeger is not seeking re-election

next year and will have to step down

in January 2015, after 12 years as the

state's insurance regulator. She'll turn

70 next year, and her husband, Mark,

a Lawrence physician, is retiring at

the beginning of January. Praeger said

both were key to her decision against

running, but she acknowledged that

she doesn't have as much ``fire'' as

she'd need to endure a tough statewide

campaign.

Analysis: Kan. Insurance Chief Isolated Within GOP

By Travis Perry
Kansas Watchdog

OSAWATOMIE, Kan. — Is your
state lawmaker doped-up on the job?
Even if he fails a drug test, you may
never know.

That was the situation described to
Kansas legislative leaders Wednesday
after discussing provisions in a bill
passed earlier this year that permits
drug testing of welfare recipients and
elected officials in the Kansas House
and Senate.

While S.B. 149 (read a summary
here) clearly outlines punitive meas-
ures for drug users receiving govern-
ment cash assistance, the same can’t
be said for their legislative counter-
parts. The law states that both can be
subjected to testing if there is “reason-
able suspicion” of drug use, but while
welfare recipients can be barred from
receiving payments and compelled to
undergo substance abuse and job skills
programs, there’s little direction as to
what should happen if a lawmaker
tests positive for narcotics.

Jeff Russell, director of Legislative
Administrative Services, has been
charged with implementing drug test-
ing measures for state officials in the
House and Senate. He told Kansas
Watchdog that not only does the law
not detail any ramifications, but it
wouldn’t explicitly make such tests
public record, either. Russell said,
until directed otherwise, he is treating
the results as private medical records.

“I’m assuming from the get-go that
the results are confidential,” he said.

“That may or may not be the case as
we proceed down the road,” Russell

added. “I’m always going to err on the
side of (privacy).”

Moving forward, Russell is looking
to the Kansas Department of
Administration to help craft policies
pertaining to legislative drug testing,
but he said the very nature of an elect-
ed official could complicate matters.

“Most of this (existing policy) is
written to address an employee, and
its been established in various times
that legislators are not state employ-
ees,” Russell said. “They have no boss
other than their constituents.”

But the Internal Revenue Service
disagrees. According to the IRS, at
least for taxing purposes, “any indi-
vidual who serves as a public official
is an employee of the government for
whom he or she serves.”

Overland Park Republican Rep.
Stephanie Clayton was outraged after
hearing that drug-using state lawmak-
ers could receive special treatment.

“Drugs are against the law, and we
shouldn’t be doing them while we’re
legislators,” Clayton said. “The only
reason why I voted in favor of that
(bill) was because it would hold me to
the same standard (as welfare recipi-
ents). I don’t want to do to other peo-
ple what I wouldn’t hold to myself.”

Clayton argued that similar punitive
measures, such as suspending a law-
maker’s pay, should have been baked-
in from the start.

“The fact that it wasn’t put in with
us in the first place seems to indicate
to me someone wanted to look like we
were being equal, but we’re not,” she
added.

Lawmakers Could 

Get Special Treatment

TOPEKA, Kan. (AP) _ University

leaders in Kansas say cuts to the

Kansas Bioscience Authority’s budget

could have a negative impact on the

state. 

The KBA, which was established in

2004 to invest tax dollars in and nur-

ture new companies in the biosciences

and life sciences fields, had been oper-

ating on a budget of more than $35

million per year in some years. State

funding support, however, has fallen

to about $4 million this year. 

Kansas University Chancellor

Bernadette Gray-Little said the KBA

helped the KU Cancer Center attain

the National Cancer Institute designa-

tion. She said the KBA’s current fund-

ing is not even close that of previous

years, and the drop will hurt the uni-

versity’s effort to achieve comprehen-

sive cancer center designation to

expand the center’s focus, The

Lawrence Journal-World reported

(http://bit.ly/1fMf2kj ). 

``That is a huge loss,’‘ Gray-Little

said. 

In 2011 and 2012, the KBA came

under scrutiny from Gov. Sam

Brownback and other conservative

Republicans over management and

investments under former CEO Tom

Thornton, who resigned in 2011 for a

job in Ohio. A $1 million audit of the

KBA found that the KBA board had

handled investments in an acceptable

manner, but alleged some question-

able spending by Thornton. 

Kansas State University President

Kirk Schulz also said the lack of KBA

funding will hurt efforts to recruit top-

ranked professors. The KBA helped

the state land the National Bio and

Agro-Defense Facility, which is pro-

posed to be built in Manhattan. 

``I don’t think that’s positive for the

state of higher education in Kansas,’‘

Schulz said. ``I’m hopeful to see fund-

ing turn around.’‘ 

Gray-Little and Schulz made their

comments this past week after a KBA

report to the Kansas Board of

Regents. 

K-State, KU Bemoan

Biosience Funding Loss

Wyco Moves Step Closer To Ballpark Purchase



of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session.

3:11 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Leon Hobson) and to protect
the privacy of the employee,
the open meeting to resume in
the County Commission
Chambers at 3:34 p.m. Wells
seconded. Carried 3-0. 

3:34 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session. 

3:34 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Leon Hobson) and to protect
the privacy of the employee,
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3995 The
Works

Motorcraft oil and filter change, rotate and inspect four

tires, inspect brake system, test battery, check air and cabin

filters, check belts and hoses. Top off all fluids.

Offer valid with coupon. Taxes extra. Expires 60 days

from 12-19-13.

Dick Edwards Ford Lincoln Mercury
7929 E. Highway 24, Manhattan, 785-776-4004

Courthouse NewsCourthouse News

The Board of County
Commissioners

Of Riley County, Kansas

The Regular meeting of the
Board of County Commission-
ers met at the Riley County
Plaza East Building December
16, 2013 with the following
members present:  Dave Lewis,
Chair; Robert Boyd, Vice
Chair; Ron Wells, Member; and
Rich Vargo, County Clerk.

8:30 Pledge of Allegiance
Public Comment,

Commission Comments, &
Business Meeting

Clancy Holeman, Counselor/
Director of Administrative
Services; Johnette Shepek,
Budget and Finance Officer;
Laura Monsanto, KMAN; Leon
Hobson, Public Works
Director/County Engineer;
Amy Manges, Deeds Super-
visor/Deputy Register of
Deeds; Eileen King, Treasurer;
Julie Merklin, League of
Women Voters; and Cindy
Volanti, Human Resource
Manager/Deputy Clerk, attend-
ed.

Boyd moved to approve CIP
Project Funding Form for Riley
County Health Department
Public Health Clinic Offices
and furniture in the amount of
$16,852.30. Wells seconded.
Carried 3-0.

Boyd moved to appoint Pam
Nelssen to the Fair Board, term
expiration December 31, 2017.
Wells seconded. Carried 3-0.

King asked for permission to
close the Riley County
Treasurer’s Office to the public
at 12:00 (noon) on December
31, 2013 for year-end process-
ing.

The Board agreed by con-
sensus to the closure of the
Riley County Treasurer’s
Office to the public at 12:00
(noon) on December 31, 2013
for year-end processing.

Boyd moved to approve the
minutes of December 12, 2013
as approved. Wells seconded.
Carried 3-0.

9:00 Leon Hobson, Public
Works Director/ County
Engineer

Bid opening for tractor,
loader, and backhoe

Clancy Holeman, Counselor/
Director of Administrative
Services; Johnette Shepek,
Budget and Finance Officer;
Laura Monsanto, KMAN; Julie
Merklin, League of Women
Voters; Kristina Jackson,
Manhattan Mercury; and John
Allard, Riley County Council
on Aging Chair, attended.

The Board of County
Commissioners opened the fol-
lowing bids for tractor/
loader/backhoe.

Company New
5-year lease 7-year
lease Used

KanEquip, Inc.
18035 East Hwy. 24
Wamego, KS  66547

No bid No bid No bid 

The Victor L. Phillips
Company

1305 SW 42nd Street
Topeka, KS  66609
$ 86,462.00 No bid

No bid

Foley Equipment
5104 Skyway Drive
Manhattan, KS  66503

$108,000.00 $14,402.86
lease/year

$50,000.00 buy back
No bid

G.W. Van Keppel
3501 SE 21st Street
Topeka, KS  66607

$110,272.00
$105,667.00 new lease

$  15,902.41 lease/year
$  35,000.00 buy back

$110,667.00 new lease
$  14,223.88 lease/year 
$  25,000.00 buy back

KanEquip, Inc.
408 Lincoln Avenue
Wamego, KS  66547
$  82,250.00
No bid No bid $80,875.00

Boyd moved to refer the bids
to staff for evaluation and rec-
ommendation. Wells seconded.
Carried 3-0.

9:13 Johnette Shepek,
Budget and Finance Officer

Clancy Holeman, Counselor
/Director of Administrative
Services; Laura Monsanto,
KMAN; Julie Merklin, League
of Women Voters; Kristina
Jackson, Manhattan Mercury;
and John Allard, Riley County
Council on Aging Chair,
attended.

Shepek reported the Budget
and Planning Committee
agreed by consensus to not

include the Motor Vehicle
Operation Fund 2013 budget
amendment. Shepek stated the
Budget and Planning
Committee will review the
Riley County Financial
Policies and presented a recom-
mendation to the Board in the
future.

Shepek presented the 2013
budget amendment.

Notice of Hearing on
Amending the 2013 Budget

The governing body of  Riley
County will meet on the day
of December 26, 2013 at 9:15
a.m. at the Riley County
Commission Chambers, 115 N.
4th St. for the purpose of hear-
ing and answering objections
of taxpayers relating to the pro-
posed amended use of funds.

Detailed budget information
is available at  and will be
available at this hearing.

Summary of Amendments
2013 Proposed

2013 Adopted Budget
Amendment

Actual Amount of Tax
Fund Tax Rate to be

Levied Expenditures
Expenditures

County Auction Fund
0.000 0 47,130
255,985

Capital Improvements Fund
0.000 0 1,500,000
3,867,823

RCPD Fund 6.819
3,592,649 3,898,121
4,086,255

Resourceful Kansas Fund
0.000 0 500,000
512,062

Bond & Interest Fund
0.167 87,936 883,394
2,061,695

Road & Bridge Capital
Project Fund 0.000 0
1,106,058 3,825,445

Register of Deed Tech Fund
0.000 0 130,100
149,897

County Building Fund
0.568 299,300 383,000
625,766

Economic Development
Fund 0.000 0
340,000 1,007,811

Riley County Rural Fire
District #1 4.903
487,693 563,918 590,293

Boyd moved to approve the
“Notice of Hearing on
Amending the 2013 Budget.”
Wells seconded. Carried 3-0.

9:30 Press Conference
Eileen King, Treasurer;

Brent Sigman, REACH
Committee Chair; Leon
Hobson, Public Works
Director/County Engineer;
Cindy Volanti, Human
Resource Manager/Deputy
Clerk; Angel Dillon, REACH
Committee Member; Lori
Muir, REACH Committee
Member; Laura Monsanto,
KMAN; Julie Merklin, League
of Women Voters; Kristina
Jackson, Manhattan Mercury;
and John Allard, Riley County
Council on Aging Chair,
attended.

King reported the 1st half
taxes are due December 20,
2013 and 2nd half taxes are due
May 10, 2014.

Allard presented an update
on the Riley County Council on
Aging.

Sigman discussed the fol-
lowing REACH programs:

Adopted three families for
Christmas, Coat, hat, and mit-
ten tree donations, 

Monday, December 23, 2013
Riley County Employee
Christmas Cheer potluck.

Hobson said the bridge
replacement project on West
40th Avenue is scheduled to
begin on Monday, December
16, 2013. The project is located
approximately ¼ mile north of
McDowell Creek Road. West
40th Avenue will be closed to
through traffic from McDowell
Creek Road north one mile to
South 33rd Street. Traffic will
need to use alternate routes
throughout the duration of this
project.    

Hobson said the project has
been allotted 105 working days
and is expected to be complet-
ed in June 2014.

Lewis announced Riley
County Offices will be closed
at 12:00 (noon) Tuesday,
December 24, 2013;
Wednesday, December 25,
2013; and January 1, 2014.
Lewis said the Treasurer’s
Office will close to the public
at 12:00 (noon) Tuesday,
December 31, 2013 for year-
end processing. 

10:10 Clancy Holeman,
Counselor/Director of Adm-
inistrative Services

Administrative Work
Session

10:10 Boyd moved that the

County Commission recess
into executive session on
potential litigation for the pur-
pose of consultation with an
attorney for the County
Commission which would be
deemed privileged in the attor-
ney-client relationship, an
exception to the Kansas Open
Meetings Act, the open meeting
to resume in the County
Commission Chambers at
10:30 a.m. Wells seconded.
Carried 3-0.

10:30 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.

No binding action was taken
during the executive session.

10:30 Greg Lund, Parks
Manager

Leon Hobson, Public Works
Director/County Engineer;
Laura Monsanto, KMAN; Julie
Merklin, League of Women
Voters; Kristina Jackson,
Manhattan Mercury; Trent
Armbrust, Manhattan Area
Chamber of Commerce;
Johnette Shepek, Budget and
Finance Officer; and Craig
Cox, Assistant County
Counselor, attended.

Lund presented a review of
the CiCo Park Master Plan.

10:45 Gary Stith, Flint Hills
Regional Council and Bill
Clark, Executive Director Flint
Hills Regional Council

Craig Cox, Assistant County
Counselor; Johnette Shepek,
Budget and Finance Officer;
Laura Monsanto, KMAN; Julie
Merklin, League of Women
Voters; Kristina Jackson,
Manhattan Mercury; Rod
Harms; and Trent Armbrust,
Manhattan Area Chamber of
Commerce, attended.

Clark presented a
PowerPoint presentation on the
Flint Hills Frontiers project.

Stith presented a PowerPoint
presentation on the Compre-
hensive Economic Develop-
ment Strategy for the Flint Hills
Region. 

11:30 Rich Vargo, County
Clerk

Craig Cox, Assistant County
Counselor; Johnette Shepek,
Budget and Finance Officer;
Laura Monsanto, KMAN; Julie
Merklin, League of Women
Voters; and Cindy Volanti,
Human Resource
Manager/Deputy Clerk, attend-
ed.

Vargo presented the Clerk’s
Office 2013 Accomplishments
and 2014 Goals.

12:00 Law Enforcement
Agency Meeting

1:30 Executive Sessions to
discuss department head evalu-
ations 

1:30 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Robert Nall) and to protect the
privacy of the employee, the
open meeting to resume in the
County Commission Chambers
at 1:40 p.m. Wells seconded.
Carried 3-0. 

1:45 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session.

1:45 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Robert Nall) and to protect the
privacy of the employee, the
open meeting to resume in the
County Commission Chambers
at 2:05 p.m. Wells seconded.
Carried 3-0. 

2:05 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session. 

2:05 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Robert Nall) and to protect the
privacy of the employee, the
open meeting to resume in the
County Commission Chambers
at 2:15 p.m. Wells seconded.
Carried 3-0. 

2:15 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session. 

2:15 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel

Riley County Commission Minutes
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Shelly Williams) and to pro-
tect the privacy of the employ-
ee, the open meeting to resume
in the County Commission
Chambers at 2:25 p.m. Wells
seconded. Carried 3-0. 

2:25 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session.

2:25 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Shelly Williams) and to pro-
tect the privacy of the employ-
ee, the open meeting to resume
in the County Commission
Chambers at 2:45 p.m. Wells
seconded. Carried 3-0. 

2:45 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session. 

2:46 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Shelly Williams) and to pro-
tect the privacy of the employ-
ee, the open meeting to resume
in the County Commission
Chambers at 2:50 p.m. Wells
seconded. Carried 3-0. 

2:50 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session. 

3:00 Boyd moved that the
County Commission recess
into executive session pursuant
to the non-elected personnel
matters exception to the Kansas
Open Meetings Act in order to
discuss a performance matter
involving a county employee
(Leon Hobson) and to protect
the privacy of the employee,
the open meeting to resume in
the County Commission
Chambers at 3:10 p.m. Wells
seconded. Carried 3-0. 

3:11 Boyd moved to go out

The Next Riley County General Election Will Be

November 4, 2014

Readers...
The Riley County Commissioners are marching to takeover the financing

of all major projects in Manhattan and Riley County. The City of
Manhattan is $278 million in Debt. The State of Kansas has a law that lim-
its the amount of Debt a City or County can have. Manhattan is within $50
million of reaching the limit. $50 million sounds like a lot of money but the
City and the Manhattan Chamber of Commerce have been working for the
past year with a "Private" Group to takeover the City Parks and spend $52
million. In doing so they would destroy about everything build in the last 20
years. That one project would put Manhattan above the State Debt Limit so
they need help.

Any project financed by the Public Building Commission  would not
count against the Total City Debt. It gives them a way to go around the State
Law. There will be no stopping the Cities ability to take City Debt to new
heights.

There is an old joke.. "How can you tell if a politician is lying? Their lips
are moving." Well the Riley County Commission's lips have been moving
but we do not want to call them liars, they have just been telling Citizens
one thing and doing another.

For months the Free Press has been asking Citizens to call the
Commissioners about the Public Building Commission but the
Commissioner have been responding by saying that any Public Building
Commission will only be used for Riley County Projects. But look at the
December 19th issue of the  Manhattan Free Press at manhattanfreep-
ress.com. 

We print the new Bylaws  and look at what the Commission is going to
pass: "ARTICLE VII

Projects Excluded - The PBC shall not have authority to approve financ-
ing for any public building project of a unified school district, university or
college."

They are not "Excluding" the City of Manhattan or the State of Kansas.

Jon A. Brake
Publisher Manhattan Free Press and
the Blue Rapids Free Press 

Riley County
Commissioner 

Bob Boyd
785-537-6357

Riley County
Commissioner 

Ron Wells
785-565-6213

Riley County
Commissioner 

Dave Lewis
785-313-0781

the open meeting to resume in
the County Commission
Chambers at 3:44 p.m. Wells
seconded. Carried 3-0. 

3:44 Boyd moved to go out
of executive session. Wells sec-
onded. Carried 3-0.  

No binding action was taken
during the executive session. 

3:45 Robert Nall, IT/GIS
Director

Craig Cox, Assistant County
Counselor; Laura Monsanto,
KMAN; Dawn Shoffner,
Assistant IT Director; Cindy
Kabriel, Administrative
Assistant II; Leon Hobson,
Public Works Director/County
Engineer; and Cindy Volanti,
Human Resource
Manager/Deputy Clerk, attend-
ed.

Nall discussed implementing
a paperless agenda/minutes
solution.

Boyd moved to approve the
Contractual Provisions
Attachment with IQM2, Inc.
and to allow IT/GIS
Department to proceed. Wells
seconded. Carried 3-0.  

4:15 Boyd moved to adjourn.
Wells seconded. Carried 3-0.
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With this coupon and one paid admission

two may shoot!
Pistol and Rifle Ranges open 4th thursday - the first and third full

weekends each month,10:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m.

At Fancy Creek State Park, Randolph Kansas

Take a Pal Shooting

FANCY CREEK RANGE

If you like the Free Press please tell these Advertisers

Optical Perspectives
WWe’ve Moved to our New Location

Larry Kluttz 930 Hayes Drive, Suite E. 
Certified Optician                       Manhattan, Kansas
Owner

(785)539-5105                                    Fax: (785)539-2324

TTTaayy lloorr ’’ss   FFaammii llyy   HHaaiirr CCaarree

All your Family’s Styling needs 

Booth Rental Available
3tl778855--553399--77775511

Monday Thru Saturday

314-C Tuttle Creek Blvd. Manhattan KS

See Faye, Marissa or MarianneSee Faye Taylor  or Angela Wilson

Top 10 Broken Obamacare Promises
By Alyene Senger
Heritage Foundation

Since the passage of
Obamacare in 2010, many of
the President’s famous promis-
es have been routinely broken.
As he so ironically threatened
in 2009, “If you misrepresent
what’s in this plan, we will call
you out.”[1] To that end, here
are 10 promises of Obamacare
that have already proved to be
broken.

Promise #1: “If you like
your health care plan, you’ll be
able to keep your health care
plan, period.”

Reality: Millions of
Americans have lost and will
lose their coverage due to
Obamacare.

Obamacare has significantly
disrupted the market for those
who buy coverage on their own
by imposing new coverage and
benefit mandates, causing a
reported 4.7 million health
insurance cancelations of an
existing policy in 32 states.

For those with employer-
sponsored insurance in the
group market, the
Congressional Budget Office
(CBO) projects that 7 million
fewer people will have employ-
ment-based insurance by 2018.

Moreover, the
Administration itself has
admitted that employers would
not keep their existing health
plans. Federal regulations writ-
ten in 2010 estimated that 51
percent of small and large
employers would lose their
“grandfathered status” by
2013—meaning a majority of
employers would not keep their

existing health plans.
Promise #2: “[T]hat means

that no matter how we reform
health care, we will keep this
promise to the American peo-
ple: If you like your doctor, you
will be able to keep your doc-
tor, period.”

Reality: Many Americans
might not be able to keep their
current doctor without paying
extra.

Many plans offered on
Obamacare’s exchanges have
very limited provider networks,
decreasing the chances con-
sumers will be able to keep
their current doctor without
paying more money.
Furthermore, many Americans
who purchase coverage on their
own have had their existing
health plans changed or can-
celed due to Obamacare, result-
ing in some people being
unable to keep their current
doctors without paying addi-
tional money to do so.

Due to the significant pay-
ment reductions included in
Obamacare, seniors with
Medicare Advantage plans may
be forced to find new doctors.
The largest provider of these
plans, UnitedHealth, has
recently reduced its provider
networks in several states.

Promise #3: “In an Obama
administration, we’ll lower pre-
miums by up to $2,500 for a
typical family per year.”

Reality: Premiums for peo-
ple purchasing coverage in the
individual market have signifi-
cantly increased in a majority
of states.

A Heritage analysis shows

that, on average, consumers in
42 states will see their premi-
ums in the exchanges increase,
many by over 100 percent.

For people with employer-
sponsored coverage, costs also
continue to increase. For fami-
lies, premiums from 2009 to
2013 have increased by an
average of $2,976.

Promise #4: “[F]or the 85
and 90 percent of Americans
who already have health insur-
ance, this thing’s already hap-
pened. And their only impact is
that their insurance is stronger,
better and more secure than it
was before. Full stop. That’s it.
They don’t have to worry about
anything else.”

Reality: Obamacare impos-
es certain new benefit man-
dates on those with employer-
sponsored coverage—a majori-
ty of Americans.

These mandates increase the
cost of coverage. In fact, feder-
al regulations written in 2010
assumed “that the increases in
insurance benefits will be
directly passed on to the con-
sumer in the form of higher
premiums. These assumptions
bias the estimates of premium
changes upward.”

But higher premiums not
only cost people more money;
they have other impacts on
coverage as well. For instance,
as a response to the direct cost
increases associated with
Obamacare, UPS dropped cov-
erage for spouses of employees
if they are offered coverage
through their own employers.

Promise #5: “Under my
plan, no family making less

than $250,000 a year will see
any form of tax increase.”

Reality: Obamacare con-
tains 18 separate tax hikes,
fees, and penalties, many of
which heavily impact the mid-
dle class.

Altogether, Obamacare’s
taxes and penalties will accu-
mulate over $770 billion in
new revenue over a 10-year
period. Among the taxes that
will hit the middle class are the
individual mandate tax, the
medical device tax, and new
penalties and limits on health
savings accounts and flexible
spending accounts.

Promise #6: “I will not sign
a plan that adds one dime to our
deficits—either now or in the
future.”

Reality: Obamacare’s new
spending is unsustainable.

Obamacare was passed into
law relying on a wide variety of
unrealistic budget projections.
A more realistic assessment
reveals that it will be a multi-
trillion-dollar budget buster.
The Government Accountabil-
ity Office (GAO) estimated the
cost of Obamacare over the
long term if certain cost-con-
tainment measures were over-
ridden. Under that alternative
scenario, which assumes that
“historical trends and policy
preferences continue,” the
GAO found that Obamacare
would increase the primary
deficit by 0.7 percent of gross
domestic product (GDP).

Senator Jeff Sessions
(R–AL) and the Senate Budget
Committee staff, who commis-
sioned the GAO report, trans-

lated the 75-year percentage
estimate into today’s dollar
amount, which would be $6.2
trillion over the next 75 years.

Promise #7: “[W]hatever
ideas exist in terms of bending
the cost curve and starting to
reduce costs for families, busi-
nesses, and government, those
elements are in this bill.”

Reality: Health spending is
still rising and is projected to
grow at an average rate of 5.8
percent from 2012 to 2022.

While growth in health
spending has been slower
recently compared to the past,
that is largely due to the slug-
gish economic recovery.
Indeed, Obamacare’s new enti-
tlements will help drive greater
health spending in 2014 and
beyond.

Promise #8: “I will protect
Medicare.”

Reality: Obamacare cuts
Medicare spending.

Obamacare makes unprece-
dented and unrealistic payment
reductions to Medicare
providers and Medicare
Advantage plans in order to
finance the new spending in the
law. The cuts amount to over
$700 billion from 2013 to
2022. If Congress allows these
draconian reductions to take
place, it will significantly
impact seniors’ ability to access
care.

Promise #9: “I will sign a
universal health care bill into
law by the end of my first term

as president that will cover
every American.”[27]

Reality: Millions of
Americans will remain unin-
sured.

Despite spending nearly $1.8
trillion in new spending from
2014 to 2023, the law falls far
short of universal coverage.
Indeed, Obamacare is projected
by the CBO to leave 31 million
uninsured after a decade of full
implementation.

Promise #10: “So this law
means more choice, more com-
petition, lower costs for mil-
lions of Americans.”

Reality: Obamacare has not
increased insurer competition
or consumer choice.

In the vast majority of states,
the number of insurers compet-
ing in the state’s exchange is
actually less than the number of
carriers that previously sold
individual market policies in
the state.[30] And at the local
level, for 35 percent of the
nation’s counties, exchange
enrollees will have a choice of
plans from only two insurers—
a duopoly. In 17 percent of
counties, consumers will have
no choice—a monopoly—as
only one carrier is offering cov-
erage in the exchange.

—Alyene Senger is a
Research Associate in the
Center for Health Policy
Studies at The Heritage
Foundation.

209 Sarber Ln

“We care about you and your car”

• Tune ups, electrical repairs

• Heater & A/C service

• Computer engine analysis

• Transmission service

• Mon.-Fri. 7:30 am to 5:30 pm

Car Clinic, Inc.

539-1040

http://www.dremmanhattan.com/

CALL 537-7701

Now Leasing 1-4 Bedrooms

R E A L  E S T A T E M A N A G E M E N T

2049 Ft. Riley Blvd., Manhattan, KS

Special Gov╒t Programs for
Mobile Homes $0 Down for
Land Owners.  FREE Const
Loans.  Will match your tax
refund up to $8,000. Used
Homes $29,900-$59,900.  All
Credit Types Accepted.  Habla
Espanol!   866-858-6862

Sporting Goods
GUN SHOW DEC 27-28-29

FRI. 1-6, SAT. 9-5 & SUN. 9-3
WICHITA KANSAS COLISE-
UM (I-35 & EAST 85TH
STREET NORTH) BUY-
SELL-TRADE INFO: (563)
927-8176

Adoption
ANSWER OUR PRAYERS!

Loving married couple wishes
to adopt newborn into a home
filled with happiness, security
and love.  Call for more info 1-
800-492-2011.

Help Wanted
Partners In Excellence OTR

Drivers APU Equipped Pre-
Pass EZ-pass passenger policy.
2012 & Newer equipment.
100% NO touch. Butler
Transport 1-800-528-7825
www.butlertransport.com

Help Wanted/Truck Driver

Drivers -  CDL-A. Train and
work for us! Professional,
focused CDL training avail-
able. Choose Company Driver,
Owner Operator, Lease
Operator or Lease Trainer.
(877) 369-7885
www.CentralTruckDrivingJobs
.com

Help Wanted/Truck Driver
Exp. Flatbed Drivers:

Regional opportunities now
open with plenty of freight &
great pay! 800-277-0212 or dri-
veforprime.com

Misc. For Sale

Free Press Classifieds.. Check on all

of Kansas

State’s

Football

games with

write ups and

photos at

manhattan-

freepress.com



MEMBER FDIC | EQUAL HOUSING LENDER 

Solutions for YOU! 
Personal and Business Solutions
Online Banking including Online Bill Payment 
Mobile Banking with apps for Android™ and iPhone®

Convenient ATMs 

Westloop | Aggieville | Downtown | Highway 24 | Junction City | 785-587-4000

Now offering online account opening!
ksstatebank.com
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By Bob Strawn, 
Mayor emeritus

The bonded debt limit for

cities across Kansas is 30% of

their assessed valuation.  You

know where we’re headed here

already, don’t you.

Manhattan’s current valuation,

the value of all the “taxable”

properties in town including

vehicles, is a tad over $500 mil-

lion.  So, the city’s debt limit is

30% of that or about $150 mil-

lion.

Now, we often hear

Manhattan’s debt is around

$275 million and wonder how

it can be twice the state’s statu-

tory limit?  Well, it’s because

there are all sorts of exemp-

tions including much of the

debt incurred as part of the

north and south redevelopment

areas.  Those were largely

financed with bonds secured

mostly by sales taxes, through

what you’ll remember as tax

increment financing (TIF) and

STAR bonds.  The latter were

secured by the state’s 6.15%

share of the 8.9% sales tax col-

lected within the two districts.

The state rebates their sales tax

share to the city for those

bonds.  Thus, a lot of the rede-

velopment debt is exempt from

the city’s limit.

We’re told that exceptions

also include bonds issued for

storm sewers, municipal utili-

ties, and improvements to inter-

sections of streets and alleys

that are immediately in front of

city or school district property.

We’re not sure why that part is

exempt, but hey, it’s the gov-

ernment, folks.  And to compli-

cate the matter even further,

there are about 70 other statutes

that contain specific exemp-

tions.

And not surprisingly, some

cities have higher limits than

the statute allows.  Junction

City, for example, has a 37%

limit because, presumably like

Detroit recently, they would

have had to declare bankruptcy

if held to 30%.  Junction’s rela-

tively massive debt came when

city central planners approved

too much land development in

preparation for the Big Red

One’s return from Germany.

And then their developer

friends reneged on paying the

city’s special taxes that

financed their city streets and

sewers.  Thankfully, we’ve had

little of that horseplay here.

So, Manhattan actually has

about $100 million in general

obligation debt that applies to

its $150 million statutory limit.

The debt is made up of tempo-

rary notes, general obligation

bonds and special assessment

bonds.  Specials finance streets

and sewers like those in

Junction, which are intended to

be paid by the associated land

owners as part of their property

taxes.  

Temporary notes, on the

other hand, provide short term

cash to finance these and other

city projects.  The notes are

Over Easy...

Bob Strawn

The Conservative Side...

Opinion PageOpinion Page

later converted to long term

bonds.  But for the past several

years, temp notes have carried

lower interest rates than bonds.

So, the city has used them to

their fullest.

Obviously, we were more

than a little fortunate that TIF

and STAR bonds were avail-

able for downtown redevelop-

ment financing.  And in the

case of STAR’s, the city was

able to justify - with the Flint

Hills Discovery Center - the

state contributing $50 million

to the overall cost.  However,

the statutory limit remains with

projects looming like the $54

million Fieldhouse Project,

which we have addressed

before and will again. 

Merry Christmas and Happy

New Year! 
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Gas 4 Less U-Haul

917 N 3rd St, Manhattan, Ks 66502
(785) 323-0307 - Mon-Sat 9-5

Wednesday Wednesday
Night

Weather for Manhattan, Ks

Apple-Crisp Orange
Pound Cake

Fall Baking Recipe Magazine Contest 2010
Winner Ordinary pound cake gets a cozy and
delicious fall twist with apples, oranges and
pecans – ready in just four steps! 

Ingredients

Filling 
2 cups chopped peeled baking apples (about 2 medi-
um) 

1/4 cup apple jelly 

1 tablespoon Gold Medal® all-purpose flour 

1/2 teaspoon apple pie spice 

Cake and Topping 
1 1/3 cups Gold Medal® all-purpose flour 

1 1/4 cups sugar 

1 teaspoon grated orange peel 

1/4 teaspoon baking powder 

1/4 teaspoon salt 

3/4 cup cold butter or margarine 

1/3 cup sour cream 

2 eggs 

1 teaspoon vanilla 

1/2 cup chopped pecans 

Directions

1 Heat oven to 350°F. Grease 9-inch round or 8-inch

square pan with shortening or cooking spray.

2 In small bowl, mix all filling ingredients; set aside. In

medium bowl, mix 1 1/3 cups flour, the sugar, orange

peel, baking powder and salt. Cut in butter, using pastry

blender (or pulling 2 table knives through ingredients in

opposite directions), until small crumbs form. Reserve 1

cup of the crumb mixture for topping. To remaining crumb

mixture in bowl, add sour

cream, eggs and vanilla;

beat with electric mixer on

medium speed about 1

minute or until blended. 

3 Spread batter in pan.

Spoon filling over batter

and spread evenly. Sprinkle

with reserved crumb mix-

ture and the pecans; pat

gently. 

4 Bake 65 to 70 minutes or

until light golden brown

and toothpick inserted in

center comes out with a

few moist crumbs clinging.

Cool 30 minutes. Serve

warm if desired. 
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By JEFFREY PARSON
Associated Press

WICHITA, Kan. (AP) _ At

the media timeout with 7:51

remaining and his team leading

No. 21 Gonzaga by two,

Kansas State coach Bruce

Weber challenged his players. 

Weber told them the

Bulldogs had put up nearly 30

points in the second half. 

``They had been scoring a

little too easy,’‘ Weber said. ``I

told our guys we needed to get

stops right then. They were at

52. And they stayed at 52 for a

long time.’‘ 

Indeed, Gonzaga scored only

two points in the next seven

minutes after that timeout, key-

ing Kansas State’s 72-62 upset

victory. 

Thomas Gipson scored eight

of his 14 points for K-State (8-

3) during that seven-minute

stretch. Marcus Foster also fin-

ished with 14 while Wesley

Iwundu had 13 and Shane

Southwell added 11. 

Kevin Pangos led Gonzaga

(10-2) with 14 points while

reserve Drew Barham had 13

points. David Stockton and

Przemek Karnowski each

scored 10. 

The Bulldogs entered the

game averaging 87.5 points and

had not scored fewer than 68

this season. 

``We just missed a lot of

wide open shots,’‘ Gonzaga

coach Mark Few said. ``That

and not getting to the free

throw line were huge for us.’‘ 

Kansas State was 19 of 25

from the foul line while the

Bulldogs were 7 of 15. 

Gonzaga played the second

half without second-leading

scorer Sam Dower, who took a

hard fall late in the first half

and did not return. 

``He was in a lot of pain in

Kansas State Beats No. 21 Gonzaga 72-62

K-State’s Thomas Gipson (left) scored 8 of his 14 points in the final 7 minutes. (File Photo by Ben Brake)

K-State’s Freshman Guard Marcus Foster (2) takes the ball

under the basket for two points. (File Photo by Ben Brake)

his lower back,’‘ Few said.

``(The doctors) were so con-

cerned, they took him for an X-

ray.’‘ 

Southwell kept his team’s

momentum going right after

halftime, scoring five straight

to give the Wildcats a 33-24

lead with 18:46 to play. 

Then Foster, a freshman

among the top 10 scorers in the

Big 12, had his stretch, going

on a personal 7-3 run with a 3-

pointer, a layup and monster

slam over Stockton. 

The Wildcats led 40-32 and

the crowd was buzzing. 

``Marcus is so athletic,’‘ said

Southwell, who made the pass

to Foster on the play for one of

his six assists. ``As soon as he

got it and could get up, I knew

it was over for Stockton.’‘ 

But the Bulldogs answered

as Gary Bell’s 3-pointer capped

a 7-0 run that pulled the

Bulldogs within 40-39 with

14:48 to play. 

After that, the teams

exchanged the lead eight times

in six minutes. 

``The tempo had been at

their tempo, but we were able

to finally get it up and down a

little and get back in the

game,’‘ Few said. ``We were in

position. But then they made all

the plays from that moment

forward.’‘ 

Gipson was the key. Twice

then 6-foot-7 Gipson posted up

the tiring Karnowski, a 7-footer

forced into extended minutes

by Dower’s injury, for baskets. 

The second one gave Kansas

State a 60-54 lead with 3:39

remaining. Karnowski entered

the game averaging 23 minutes

but played 30 Saturday, 17 of

them in the second half. 

``He was definitely tired,’‘

Few said. 

Gipson’s putback with 1:59

to play pushed the lead to eight,

and the Wildcats could milk out

a victory from there. 

``I just wanted to be active _

ball screen, roll and get posted

up down low,’‘ Gipson said. ``I

knew I could get offensive

rebounds or easy hook shots.’‘ 

Gonzaga, among the top 20

nationally in scoring, had real

difficulties finding its offense

in the first half. 

The Bulldogs had just 19

points in the game’s first 17

minutes and trailed by five. 

But Kyle Dranginis followed

a driving layup with a 3-point-

er, making the score 24-24 with

1:49 remaining in the half. 

Kansas State scored the

half’s final five points on a 3 by

Nigel Johnson and a layup by

Nino Williams for a 29-24 lead.

Gonzaga had not scored fewer

than 31 points in a first half this

season. 

By DAVE SKRETTA
AP Sports Writer

KANSAS CITY, Mo. (AP) _

Kansas State rewarded athletic

director John Currie with a

raise and a one-year contract

extension on Friday after one

of the most successful stretches

in school history. 

Not only did the Kansas

State capture Big 12 champi-

onships in football, men’s bas-

ketball and baseball within the

same year in 2012-13, the

school also has embarked on

$125 million in facility

improvements spearheaded by

Currie that have revitalized the

athletic department. 

``I think we’re still focused

on the same vision we’ve had,’‘

Currie told The Associated

Press in a phone interview

Friday. ``We’ve got great

momentum and I’m just

extremely excited.’‘ 

The contract extension

would keep Currie at Kansas

State through June 30, 2019.

His annual salary will increase

by $100,000 to $575,000 for

the remainder of the 2013-14

fiscal year through the 2014-15

and 2015-16 seasons, and then

increase by $25,000 each

remaining year. 

Currie is also in line for var-

ious retention incentives. 

``Our athletics department

has achieved unprecedented

success the past four years

under John’s tremendous lead-

ership,’‘ Kansas State President

Kirk Schulz said in a statement.

``John’s vision and partnership

have been critically important

to the entire university family.’‘ 

Currie, who arrived in May

2009, inherited an athletic

department that had fallen into

debt and was racked by scan-

dal. But he’s not only helped to

lift the program into the black,

he’s also helped Kansas State

embark on an ambitious series

of construction projects. 

The most recent was a $90

million renovation to Bill

Snyder Family Stadium that

was unveiled this past season.

It included the demolition of

the old press box and a new

facility stretching from end

zone to end zone that includes

enhanced club seating and

other amenities. 

Last year, the school

unveiled a new basketball

training facility adjacent to

Bramlage Coliseum. It also

opened a new rowing facility

and renovated tennis facilities. 

Away from the playing field,

Currie helped to guide Kansas

State through a tense series of

conference realignments. He

was also played a major part in

launching K-StateHD.TV, a

premium digital network that

airs programming that ranges

from football games to

Olympic sports. 

The football program, which

won the Big 12 title last season,

went 7-5 and is headed to the

Buffalo Wild Wings Bowl this

season. The men’s basketball

team led by coach Bruce Weber

_ perhaps Currie’s most signif-

icant hiring _ also won the Big

12 title last season, and is 7-3

and has won five straight

games this season. The baseball

team is also coming off a Big

12 championship. 

No doubt one of the biggest

decisions that will face Currie

in the near future is finding a

replacement for Snyder, who

turned 74 in October. When

Snyder stepped away for a brief

retirement, Ron Prince _ who

was hired by Currie’s predeces-

sors _ was unable to replicate

the success of Snyder, who is

so revered in the Flint Hills that

the highway leading to town is

named for him. 

``My focus is on continuing

to support his efforts in leading

our program,’‘ Currie told the

AP. ``I’m focused on his con-

tinued building. It’s an ongoing

process, but I think the things

we’re doing to build facilities

and expand our attendance and

brand will bode well.’‘ 

Kansas State has received 13

private gifts in excess of $1

million since Currie’s arrival,

while participation in the

Ahearn Fund has eclipsed

9,300 members for the first

time. 

Currie, who serves on the

Division I Administrative

Cabinet, was one of two athlet-

ic directors named to

SportsBusiness Journal’s Forty

Under 40 list of national sports

leaders. He was the 2012 Under

Armour AD of the Year and the

2013 Bobby Dodd AD of the

Year. 

``He brings such passion and

energy to our athletic pro-

gram,’‘ said Mike Goss, whose

name adorns the new tennis

stadium. ``When you add his

contributions to the great work

being done by President Schulz

and the rest of the K-State

team, I have no doubt that K-

State’s best days are still

ahead.’‘ 

Kansas State Gives AD Currie New Contract 
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